CONSORTIUM BID TABULATION:
SUPPLYING GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL

Brecksville, Broadview Heights, Independence, North Royalton and Seven Hills

Bid Opening: October 23,2015 9:00

a.m.

Present: Becki Riser, City of Brecksville, Ron Weidig, City of Brecksville, Jazmin Fanara, Express Courier (for Petroleum Traders)

Total Cost per Gallon Calculation: OPIS average
on order date + Differential + Taxes of $.001 Fed
LUST $.28 OH Tax $.0019 Oil Spill Tax

PETROLEUM TRADERS
(same prices Year 1 & 2)

PORTS PETROLEUM
(same prices Year 1 & 2)

GREAT LAKES PETROLEUM
(same prices Year 1 & 2)

MANSFIELD OIL CO.
(same prices Year 1 & 2)

Price Differential (Add)

Price Differential (Add)

Price Differential (Add)

Price Differential (Add)

NO LEAD PREMIUM GASOLINE, 93 OCTANE w/10% Ethanol Blend

Transport 0.0025 (0.0094) 0.0000 (0.0121)

Tankwagon No Bid 0.0900 0.0580 No Bid
BP, Marathon, Center QOil, Sun, World Oil, Shell, US Oll,

Product Bid Marathon, Musket, Global, Husky, etc. Premium Gas Valero, Husky, PBF, Global, Musket TT-No Lead Premium Gasoline, 93 Octane

Name & Location of Refiner

Marathon/Cleveland

Various Suppliers & Refiners

Various

Husky Energy, Cincinnati, OH

NO LEAD MID-GRADE GASOLINE, 89 OCTANE w/ 10% Ethanol Blend

Transport (0.0001) (0.0111) 0.0000 0.0194

Tankwagon No Bid 0.0900 0.0580 No Bid
BP, Marathon, Center Qil, Sun, World Oil, Shell, US Qil,

Product Bid Marathon, Musket, Global, Husky, etc. Mid-Grade Gas Valero, Husky, PBF, Global, Musket TT-No Lead Mid-Grade Gasoline, 89

Name & Location of Refiner Marathon/Cleveland Various Suppliers & Refiners Various Husky Energy, Cincinnati, OH

NO LEAD REGULAR GRADE GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE, w/ 10% Ethanol Blend

Transport (0.0185) (0.0311) 0.0000 0.0089

Tankwagon No Bid 0.0900 0.0580 No Bid
BP, Marathon, Center Oil, Sun, World Oil, Shell, US Oil,

Product Bid Marathon, Musket, Global, Husky, etc. Regular Gas Valero, Husky, PBF, Global, Musket TT-No Lead Regular Grade Gasoline, 87 Octane

Name & Location of Refiner Marathon/Cleveland Various Suppliers & Refiners Various Husky Energy, Cincinnati, OH

ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 DIESEL

Transport (0.0362) (0.0311) (0.0130) (0.0102)

Tankwagon No Bid 0.0900 0.0580 No Bid
BP, Marathon, Center Qil, Sun, World Oil, Shell, US Qil,

Product Bid Marathon, Musket, Global, Husky, etc. On Road Diesel Valero, Husky, PBF, Global, Musket TT-Ultra Low Sulfur #2 Diesel

Name & Location of Refiner

Marathon/Cleveland

TRANSPORT DELIVERY MINIMUM ORDER/GALLONS

Various Suppliers & Refiners

Various

Husky Energy, Cincinnati, OH & ValvTech, IL

Gasoline 7500 6000 7500 8500
Diesel 6500 6000 7500 7500
TANKWAGON DELIVERY MINIMUM ORDER/GALLONS

Gasoline NO BID 250 500 NO BID
Diesel NO BID 250 500 NO BID
EXCEPTIONS None None None|7,500 Combo for Transport Delivery, if

transport loads w/ less than quoted gallons.

Minimum freight charges will apply.
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