

**CONSORTIUM BID TABULATION:
SUPPLYING GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL**

Year 1 Contract Term: 12/9/17-12/31/18

Year 2 Contract Term: 1/1/19-12/31/19

Bid Opening: October 20, 2017 9:00 a.m.

Present: Becki Riser, City of Brecksville, Kristen Kouri, City of Brecksville, Matt Smith, Cuyahoga Landmark, Rob Lay, Ports Petroleum, Jon Kalchthaler, Guttman Energy

<i>Total Cost per Gallon Calculation: OPIS average on order date + Differential + Taxes of \$.001 Fed LUST \$.28 OH Tax \$.0019 Oil Spill Tax</i>	PETROLEUM TRADERS <i>(same prices Year 1 & 2)</i>	<i>(Using Sample Data Provided on Bid Form)</i>	PORTS PETROLEUM <i>(same prices Year 1 & 2)</i>	<i>(Using Sample Data Provided on Bid Form)</i>	GREAT LAKES PETROLEUM <i>(same prices Year 1 & 2)</i>	<i>(Using Sample Data Provided on Bid Form)</i>
	<i>Price Differential (Add)</i>	<i>Total Cost/ Gallon</i>	<i>Price Differential (Add)</i>	<i>Total Cost/ Gallon</i>	<i>Price Differential (Add)</i>	<i>Total Cost/ Gallon</i>
NO LEAD PREMIUM GASOLINE, 93 OCTANE w/10% Ethanol Blend						
Transport	(0.0217)	2.9412	0.0030	2.9659	0.0050	2.96.79
Tankwagon	NO BID	NO BID	0.0825	3.0454	0.0750	3.0379
Product Bid	Marathon, Musket, Global, Husky, etc.		Regular Gas		See listed below.*	
Name & Location of Refiner	Marathon, Cleveland, OH		Various		Various	
NO LEAD MID-GRADE GASOLINE, 89 OCTANE w/ 10% Ethanol Blend						
Transport	(0.0217)	2.5812	0.0030	2.9029	0.0050	2.6079
Tankwagon	NO BID	NO BID	0.0825	2.6854	0.0750	2.6779
Product Bid	Marathon, Musket, Global, Husky, etc.		Mid Grade/Plus		See listed below.*	
Name & Location of Refiner	Marathon, Cleveland, OH		Various		Various	
NO LEAD REGULAR GRADE GASOLINE, 87 OCTANE, w/ 10% Ethanol Blend						
Transport	(0.0217)	2.3712	0.0030	2.3959	0.0050	2.3979
Tankwagon	NO BID	NO BID	0.0825	2.4754	0.0750	2.4679
Product Bid	Marathon, Musket, Global, Husky, etc.		Regular Gas		See listed below.*	
Name & Location of Refiner	Marathon, Cleveland, OH		Various		Various	
ULTRA LOW SULFUR #2 DIESEL						
Transport	(0.0072)	1.9592	0.0030	1.9694	0.0050	1.9714
Tankwagon	NO BID	NO BID	0.0825	2.0489	0.0750	2.0414
Product Bid	Marathon, Musket, Global, Husky, etc.		ULSD		See listed below.*	
Name & Location of Refiner	Marathon, Cleveland, OH		Various		Various	
TRANSPORT DELIVERY MINIMUM ORDER/GALLONS						
Gasoline	8500		6000		7500	
Diesel	7500		6000		7500	
TANKWAGON DELIVERY MINIMUM ORDER/GALLONS						
Gasoline	NO BID		400		500	
Diesel	NO BID		400		500	
EXCEPTIONS						
	None		None		None	
					*Product Bid: BP, Marathon, Center Oil, Sun	
					World Oil, Shell, US Oil, Valero, Husky, PBF,	
					Global, Musket.	

**CONSORTIUM BID TABULATION:
SUPPLYING GASOLINE & DIESEL FUEL**

Year 1 Contract Term: 12/9/17-12/31/18

Year 2 Contract Term: 1/1/19-12/31/19

Bid Opening: October 20, 2017 9:00 a.m.

Present: Becki Riser, City of Brecksville, Kristen Kouri, City of Brecksville, Matt Smith, Cuyahoga Landmark, Rob Lay, Ports Petroleum, Jon Kalchthaler, Guttman Energy

GUTTMAN ENERGY, INC. (same prices Year 1 & 2)	(Using Sample Data Provided on Bid Form)	CUYAHOGA LANDMARK (same prices Year 1 & 2)	(Using Sample Data Provided on Bid Form)	LYKINS ENERGY SOLUTIONS (same prices Year 1 & 2)	(Using Sample Data Provided on Bid Form)	MANSFIELD OIL CO. (Year 1 Price/Optional Year 2 Price)	(Using Sample Data Provided on Bid Form)
Price Differential (Add)	Total Cost/ Gallon	Price Differential (Add)	Total Cost/ Gallon	Price Differential (Add)	Total Cost/ Gallon	Price Differential (Add)	Total Cost/ Gallon
0.0040	2.9669	0.0300	2.9929	(0.0152)	2.9477	(.0897)/(.0891)	2.8732/2.8738
NO BID	NO BID	0.1500	3.1129	0.0900	3.0529	.2426/.2432	3.2055/3.2061
		Marathon, Husky, Sun Guttman Brecksville, Cleveland, Canton, Aurora		Unbranded - 93 E10, Husky, PBF Sunoco		No Lead Prem Gas 93 Octane w/ 10% Eth BI Husky, Sunoco, Exxon, Various	
0.0040	2.6069	0.0300	2.6329	(0.0117)	2.5912	.0033/.0039	2.6062/2.6068
NO BID	NO BID	0.1500	2.7529	0.0900	2.6929	.2426/.2432	2.8455/2.8461
		Marathon, Husky, Sun Guttman Brecksville, Cleveland, Canton, Aurora		Unbranded - 89 E10, Husky, PBF Sunoco		No Lead Prem Gas 89 Octane w/ 10% Eth BI Husky, Sunoco, Exxon, Various	
0.0040	2.3969	0.0300	2.4229	(0.0056)	2.3873	.0097/.0091	2.3832/2.3838
NO BID	NO BID	0.1500	2.5429	0.0900	2.4829	.2426/.2432	2.6355/2.6361
		Marathon, Husky, Sun Guttman Brecksville, Cleveland, Canton, Aurora		Unbranded - 87 E10, Husky, PBF Sunoco		No Lead Prem Gas 87 Octane w/ 10% Eth BI Husky, Sunoco, Exxon, Various	
(0.0210)	1.9454	0.0300	1.9964	(0.0053)	1.9611	(.0182)/(.0177)	1.9482/1.9487
NO BID	NO BID	0.1500	2.1164	0.0900	2.0564	.2554/.2560	2.2218/2.2224
ULSD 15ppm Various Clev Terminals/BTS (Aurora)		Marathon, Husky, Sun Guttman Brecksville, Cleveland, Canton, Aurora		Unbranded #2ULS NGL Crude, PBF, Husky Sunoco		Ultra Low Sulfur #2 Diesel Husky, Sunoco, Exxon, Various	
7500		8500		6000		8500	
7500		7500		6000		7500	
NO BID		300		250		200	
NO BID		300		250		200	
None		See Attached.		None		None	

EXCEPTION SHEET

List here any and all exceptions to specifications upon which your bid is based. If there are no exceptions listed here, your bid will be considered to be in complete accordance with specifications.

- If awarded bid, Cuyahoga Landmark will install wireless tank monitors on all tanks we deem that require monitors.
- The monitors are Cuyahoga Landmark's equipment and will be returned to Cuyahoga Landmark at the completion of the bid.
- Diesel additive is .02064 per gallon.
- Blend fuel would be based on blend ratio cost price, plus differential.
- Payment is net 10 days EFT

NAME OF BIDDER Cuyahoga Landmark, Inc.